



Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

**BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE SINGLE CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE
BID (SCRB)/ LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (LCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT**

RESOLUTION NO. PB076-2024

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2024-04-168
Category per RA9184: GOODS INFRAWORKS CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: **"SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2024)"**
APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): **₱ 14,990,905.00**

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for the project Supply and Delivery of Books (APP 2024) with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of ₱ 14,990,905.00 in the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in Tarlac State University on May 30, 2024;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, eight (8) prospective bidders participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University BAC Conference Room and webcasted via Zoom on June 7, 2024;

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the TSU-BAC Conference Room on June 19, 2024, at 2:00 P.M.:

- (a) Two bidders, namely, Mind Mover Publishing House Inc., and C&E Publishing Inc. tendered their bids for the aforementioned project,
- (b) the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical Working Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the first envelopes contained in the bids submitted by the two bidders, using the non-discretionary "pass/fail" criterion, and found the first envelopes of Mind Mover Publishing House Inc., and C&E Publishing Inc. to contain all the required documents and were rated "passed".
- (c) the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the opening and evaluation of the second envelopes of the two bidders and found that the envelopes of the two bidders contained the prescribed documents and were rated "passed";
- (d) the BAC, with the assistance of the TWGs, evaluated and ranked the bids of the two bidders whose first and second envelopes were rated "passed",
- (e) the BAC resolved to declare Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc., is the bidder with the Single Calculated Bid (SCB)/ Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB) with an aggregate bid amount of ₱ 9,104,616.00 for the following lot numbers.

Lot No. 1 with the bid price of ₱ 393,457.00,
Lot No. 2 with the bid price of ₱ 72,516.00,
Lot No. 3 with the bid price of ₱ 390,269.00,
Lot No. 4 with the bid price of ₱ 453,927.00,
Lot No. 5 with the bid price of ₱ 195,308.00,

Page 1 of 4

Lot No. 6 with the bid price of ₱ 222,268.00,
Lot No. 7 with the bid price of ₱ 1,188,452.00,
Lot No. 9 with the bid price of ₱ 1,166,711.00,
Lot No. 10 with the bid price of ₱ 958,958.00,
Lot No. 11 with the bid price of ₱ 246,455.00,
Lot No. 14 with the bid price of ₱ 493,294.00,
Lot No. 18 with the bid price of ₱ 729,614.00,
Lot No. 19 with the bid price of ₱ 282,524.00,
Lot No. 20 with the bid price of ₱ 222,618.00,
Lot No. 23 with the bid price of ₱ 1,228,270.00,
Lot No. 24 with the bid price of ₱ 859,975.00,

- (f) the BAC resolved to C&E Publishing, Inc., as the bidder with the Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate bid amount of ₱ 4,949,384.68 for the following lot numbers.

Lot No. 8 with the bid price of ₱ 576,432.61,
Lot No. 12 with the bid price of ₱ 34,260.19,
Lot No. 13 with the bid price of ₱ 20,956.69,
Lot No. 15 with the bid price of ₱ 68,118.14,
Lot No. 16 with the bid price of ₱ 139,166.44,
Lot No. 17 with the bid price of ₱ 496,443.60,
Lot No. 21 with the bid price of ₱ 1,096,221.50,
Lot No. 22 with the bid price of ₱ 198,905.48,
Lot No. 25 with the bid price of ₱ 306,634.13,
Lot No. 26 with the bid price of ₱ 791,073.16,
Lot No. 27 with the bid price of ₱ 411,658.64,
Lot No. 28 with the bid price of ₱ 588,764.39,
Lot No. 29 with the bid price of ₱ 220,749.71,

- (g) the BAC directed the TWGs to proceed with the post-qualification evaluation of the SCB and LCB and report their findings to the BAC within the prescribed period.

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held via Zoom on August 2, 2024:

- (a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that C&E Publishing, Inc., was responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents,
- (b) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that C&E Publishing, Inc., was responsive for Lot Nos. 8, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 21, 22, 25, 26, 27, 28 & 29, to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents, and
- (c) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously agreed to declare C&E Publishing, Inc., for Lot Nos. 8, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 21, 22, 25, 26, 27, 28 & 29 as responsive.
- (d) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc., was responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents,
- (e) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc., was responsive for Lot Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 9, 10, 11, 14, 18, 19, 23 &

24, and non-responsive for Lot no. 20 to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents, and

- (f) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously agreed to declare Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc. for Lot nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 9, 10, 11, 14, 18, 19, 23 & 24, as responsive and for Lot no. 20 as non-responsive,
- (g) the BAC directed the TWGs to proceed with the post-qualification evaluation of the bid of C&E Publishing, Inc. for Lot no. 20, the second-lowest calculated bid,
- (h) the BAC directed the Secretariat to issue the Notice of Disqualification to Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc. for Lot no. 20.

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held via Zoom on August 7, 2024:

- (a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the 2nd LCB for Lot no. 20 was responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents,
- (b) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the 2nd LCB for Lot no. 20 was responsive to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents, and
- (c) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously agreed to declare the 2nd LCB for Lot no. 20 as responsive.

THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby **RESOLVE**, as it is hereby **RESOLVED**:

- (a) to declare Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc. as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB)/ Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate amount of ₱ 8,881,998.00 for the following lot numbers.

Lot No. 1 with the bid price of ₱ 393,457.00,
Lot No. 2 with the bid price of ₱ 72,516.00,
Lot No. 3 with the bid price of ₱ 390,269.00,
Lot No. 4 with the bid price of ₱ 453,927.00,
Lot No. 5 with the bid price of ₱ 195,308.00,
Lot No. 6 with the bid price of ₱ 222,268.00,
Lot No. 7 with the bid price of ₱ 1,188,452.00,
Lot No. 9 with the bid price of ₱ 1,166,711.00,
Lot No. 10 with the bid price of ₱ 958,958.00,
Lot No. 11 with the bid price of ₱ 246,455.00,
Lot No. 14 with the bid price of ₱ 493,294.00,
Lot No. 18 with the bid price of ₱ 729,614.00,
Lot No. 19 with the bid price of ₱ 282,524.00,
Lot No. 23 with the bid price of ₱ 1,228,270.00,
Lot No. 24 with the bid price of ₱ 859,975.00,

- (a) to declare C&E Publishing, Inc., as the bidder with the Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate amount of ₱ 5,220,337.57 for the following item numbers.

Lot No. 8 with the bid price of ₱ 576,432.87,
Lot No. 12 with the bid price of ₱ 34,260.19,
Lot No. 13 with the bid price of ₱ 20,956.82,
Lot No. 15 with the bid price of ₱ 68,118.16,
Lot No. 16 with the bid price of ₱ 139,166.61,
Lot No. 17 with the bid price of ₱ 496,443.94,
Lot No. 20 with the bid price of ₱ 270,950.20,
Lot No. 21 with the bid price of ₱ 1,096,221.94,
Lot No. 22 with the bid price of ₱ 198,905.56,
Lot No. 25 with the bid price of ₱ 306,634.26,
Lot No. 26 with the bid price of ₱ 791,073.41,
Lot No. 27 with the bid price of ₱ 411,658.92,
Lot No. 28 with the bid price of ₱ 588,764.66,
Lot No. 29 with the bid price of ₱ 220,750.03,

(b) to recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply and Delivery of Books (APP 2024) to Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc., for Lot Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 9, 10, 11, 14, 18, 19, 23 & 24,

(c) to recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply and Delivery of Books (APP 2024) C&E Publishing, Inc., for Lot Nos. 8, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 22, 25, 26, 27, 28 & 29.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 7th day of August 2024.


WILMARK J. RAMOS
Chairperson



GRACE N. ROSETE
Vice Chairperson


THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA
Member


RICO G. TOMAS
Member


MENCHIE DG. ABELLAR
Member


JASPER A. YAUDER
Member


CYNTHIA M. BOGNOT
Member/End-user

Approved:

DR. ARNOLD E. VELASCO
President



ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ

Project Name: **SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2024)**

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University
 Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
 Approved Budget for the Contract: ₱ 14,990,905.00

Date: June 19, 2024
 Time: 2:00 P.M.
 Venue: TSU BAC Conference Room

BIDDER	Mind Mover Publishing House Inc.	C&E Publishing Inc.
Lot No. 1	393,457.00	455,009.71
Lot No. 2	72,516.00	77,024.61
Lot No. 3	390,269.00	437,809.95
Lot No. 4	453,927.00	501,933.12
Lot No. 5	195,308.00	221,388.48
Lot No. 6	222,268.00	242,608.58
Lot No. 7	1,188,452.00	1,290,172.86
Lot No. 8	NO BID	576,432.87
Lot No. 9	1,166,711.00	1,237,255.49
Lot No. 10	958,958.00	1,039,551.59
Lot No. 11	246,455.00	255,715.95
Lot No. 12	NO BID	34,260.19
Lot No. 13	NO BID	20,956.82
Lot No. 14	493,294.00	507,896.76
Lot No. 15	NO BID	68,118.16
Lot No. 16	NO BID	139,166.61
Lot No. 17	NO BID	496,443.94
Lot No. 18	729,614.00	775,867.84
Lot No. 19	282,524.00	300,934.84
Lot No. 20	222,618.00	270,950.20
Lot No. 21	NO BID	1,096,221.94
Lot No. 22	NO BID	198,905.56
Lot No. 23	1,228,270.00	1,342,177.56
Lot No. 24	859,975.00	946,471.91
Lot No. 25	NO BID	306,634.26
Lot No. 26	NO BID	791,073.41
Lot No. 27	NO BID	411,658.92
Lot No. 28	NO BID	588,764.66
Lot No. 29	NO BID	220,750.03
Aggregate Bid Amount	8,881,998.00	5,220,337.57
Form of Bid Security	Bid Securing Declaration	Bid Securing Declaration
Validity Period	120 days	120 days
Remarks	Complying	Complying




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Goods and Services


Romulo Bldg., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph


WILMARK J. RAMOS
Chairperson


GRACE N. ROSETE
Vice Chairperson


THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA
Member


RICO G. TOMAS
Member


MENCHIE DG. ABELLAR
Member


JASPER A. YAUDER
Member


CYNTHIA M. BOGNOT
Member/ End-user


WINNIEFE F. GUTIERREZ
TWG on Financial and Legal Aspects
Chairperson


RYAN G. SIH
TWG on Technical Aspects
Chairperson

Approved:


DR. ARNOLD E. VELASCO
President



ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Project Name: **SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2024)**

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University
 Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
 Approved Budget for the Contract: ₱ 14,990,905.00

Date: June 19, 2024
 Time: 2:00 P.M.
 Venue: TSU BAC Conference Room

BIDDER	Mind Mover Publishing House Inc.	C&E Publishing Inc.
Lot No. 1	393,457.00	455,009.71
Lot No. 2	72,516.00	77,024.61
Lot No. 3	390,269.00	437,809.95
Lot No. 4	453,927.00	501,933.12
Lot No. 5	195,308.00	221,388.48
Lot No. 6	222,268.00	242,608.58
Lot No. 7	1,188,452.00	1,290,172.86
Lot No. 8	NO BID	576,432.87
Lot No. 9	1,166,711.00	1,237,255.49
Lot No. 10	958,958.00	1,039,551.59
Lot No. 11	246,455.00	255,715.95
Lot No. 12	NO BID	34,260.19
Lot No. 13	NO BID	20,956.82
Lot No. 14	493,294.00	507,896.76
Lot No. 15	NO BID	68,118.16
Lot No. 16	NO BID	139,166.61
Lot No. 17	NO BID	496,443.94
Lot No. 18	729,614.00	775,867.84
Lot No. 19	282,524.00	300,934.84
Lot No. 20	222,618.00	270,950.20
Lot No. 21	NO BID	1,096,221.94
Lot No. 22	NO BID	198,905.56
Lot No. 23	1,228,270.00	1,342,177.56
Lot No. 24	859,975.00	946,471.91
Lot No. 25	NO BID	306,634.26
Lot No. 26	NO BID	791,073.41
Lot No. 27	NO BID	411,658.92
Lot No. 28	NO BID	588,764.66
Lot No. 29	NO BID	220,750.03
Aggregate Bid Amount	8,881,998.00	5,220,337.57
Form of Bid Security	Bid Securing Declaration	Bid Securing Declaration
Validity Period	120 days	120 days
Remarks	Complying	Complying



Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Goods and Services

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

WILMARK J. RAMOS
Chairperson

GRACE N. ROSETE
Vice Chairperson

THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA
Member

RICO G. TOMAS
Member

MENCHIE DG. ABELLAR
Member

JASPER A. YAUDER
Member

CYNTHIA M. BOGNOT
Member/ End-user

WINNIEFE F. GUTIERREZ
TWG on Financial and Legal Aspects
Chairperson

RYAN G. SIH
TWG on Technical Aspects
Chairperson

Approved:

DR. ARNOLD E. VELASCO
President



(18)

Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED BID (LCB)/ SINGLE CALCULATED BID (SCB)

RESOLUTION NO. PB052-2024

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2024-04-168
 Category per RA9184: GOODS INFRA/WORKS CONSULTING
 TITLE/DESCRIPTION: **"SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2024)"**
 APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): **₱ 14,990,905.00**

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for the project Supply and Delivery of Books (APP 2024) with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of ₱ 14,990,905.00 in the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in Tarlac State University on May 30, 2024;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, eight (8) prospective bidders participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University BAC Conference Room and webcasted via Zoom on June 7, 2024;

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the TSU-BC AVR on June 19, 2024 at 2:00 P.M., two (2) bidders, namely, Mind Mover Publishing House Inc., and C&E Publishing Inc., participated and tendered their bids for the aforementioned project;

WHEREAS, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical Working Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the first envelopes contained in the bids submitted by the two bidders, using the non-discretionary "pass/fail" criterion, and found that the first envelopes of Mind Mover Publishing House Inc., and C&E Publishing Inc. contained all the required documents and were rated "passed";

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the opening and evaluation of the second envelopes of the two bidders and found that the envelopes of the two bidders contained the prescribed documents and were rated "passed";

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the evaluation of the financial bids of the two bidders with the results as summarized below:

Lot No.	ABC, ₱	Bidder			
		Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc.		C&E Publishing, Inc.	
		Bid Price (As Calculated), ₱	Rank	Bid Price (As Calculated), ₱	Rank
1	458,799.00	393,457.00	1	455,009.71	2
2	78,477.00	72,516.00	1	77,024.61	2
3	440,010.00	390,269.00	1	437,809.95	2
4	505,933.00	453,927.00	1	501,933.12	2
5	223,231.00	195,308.00	1	221,388.48	2

6	243,980.00	222,268.00	1	242,608.58	2
7	1,306,197.00	1,188,452.00	1	1,290,172.86	2
8	581,982.00	NO BID	-	576,432.61	1
9	1,244,504.00	1,166,711.00	1	1,237,255.49	2
10	1,045,703.00	958,958.00	1	1,039,551.59	2
11	257,190.00	246,455.00	1	255,715.95	2
12	34,541.00	NO BID	-	34,260.19	1
13	21,062.00	NO BID	-	20,956.69	1
14	510,449.00	493,294.00	1	507,896.76	2
15	69,310.00	NO BID	-	68,118.14	1
16	141,668.00	NO BID	-	139,166.44	1
17	500,038.00	NO BID	-	496,443.60	1
18	783,509.00	729,614.00	1	775,867.84	2
19	301,832.00	282,524.00	1	300,934.84	2
20	273,538.00	222,618.00	1	270,950.13	2
21	1,105,396.00	NO BID	-	1,096,221.50	1
22	199,905.00	NO BID	-	198,905.48	1
23	1,375,397.00	1,228,270.00	1	1,342,177.56	2
24	953,547.00	859,975.00	1	946,471.91	2
25	311,174.00	NO BID	-	306,634.13	1
26	795,289.00	NO BID	-	791,073.16	1
27	414,662.00	NO BID	-	411,658.64	1
28	591,723.00	NO BID	-	588,764.39	1
29	221,859.00	NO BID	-	220,749.71	1

NOW, THEREFORE, based on the foregoing findings, **WE**, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby **RESOLVE**, as it is hereby **RESOLVED**:

- (a) to declare Mind Mover Publishing House, Inc. as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB)/ Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate amount of ₱ 9,104,616.00 for the following lot numbers.

Lot No. 1 with the bid price of ₱ 393,457.00,
 Lot No. 2 with the bid price of ₱ 72,516.00,
 Lot No. 3 with the bid price of ₱ 390,269.00,
 Lot No. 4 with the bid price of ₱ 453,927.00,
 Lot No. 5 with the bid price of ₱ 195,308.00,
 Lot No. 6 with the bid price of ₱ 222,268.00,
 Lot No. 7 with the bid price of ₱ 1,188,452.00,
 Lot No. 9 with the bid price of ₱ 1,166,711.00,
 Lot No. 10 with the bid price of ₱ 958,958.00,
 Lot No. 11 with the bid price of ₱ 246,455.00,
 Lot No. 14 with the bid price of ₱ 493,294.00,

Lot No. 18 with the bid price of ₱ 729,614.00,
Lot No. 19 with the bid price of ₱ 282,524.00,
Lot No. 20 with the bid price of ₱ 222,618.00,
Lot No. 23 with the bid price of ₱ 1,228,270.00,
Lot No. 24 with the bid price of ₱ 859,975.00.

(b) to declare C&E Publishing, Inc., as the bidder with the Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate amount of ₱ 4,949,384.68 for the following item numbers.

Lot No. 8 with the bid price of ₱ 576,432.61,
Lot No. 12 with the bid price of ₱ 34,260.19,
Lot No. 13 with the bid price of ₱ 20,956.69,
Lot No. 15 with the bid price of ₱ 68,118.14,
Lot No. 16 with the bid price of ₱ 139,166.44,
Lot No. 17 with the bid price of ₱ 496,443.60,
Lot No. 21 with the bid price of ₱ 1,096,221.50,
Lot No. 22 with the bid price of ₱ 198,905.48,
Lot No. 25 with the bid price of ₱ 306,634.13,
Lot No. 26 with the bid price of ₱ 791,073.16,
Lot No. 27 with the bid price of ₱ 411,658.64,
Lot No. 28 with the bid price of ₱ 588,764.39,
Lot No. 29 with the bid price of ₱ 220,749.71,

(c) to direct the TWGs to proceed with the Post-Qualification Evaluation of the LCB and SCB and report their findings to the BAC within the prescribed period.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 19th day of June 2024.


GRACE N. ROSETE
Chairperson



RICO G. TOMAS
Vice Chairperson



THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA
Member


ROMMEL M. HERNANDEZ
Member


MENCHIE DG. ABELLAR
Member


JASPER A. YAUDER
Member


CYNTHIA M. BOGNOT
Member/End-user

Approved:

DR. ARNOLD E. VELASCO
President